
  
MINUTES 

 BID OPENING 
 June 29, 2016 

4:00 P.M. 
 

Present: Sandy Crawford, Procurement Manager; and Brent Morelock, Assistant Procurement Manager 
                        

The Bid Opening was held in the Council Room, City Hall. 
 

The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids: 
 

POLICE UNIFORMS 
Vendor: BKT Uniforms Bluegrass Uniforms 

& Equipment 
Summitt Uniforms CMS Uniforms & 

Equipment 
Galls 

Item #      
1 Elbeco - $46.97 $63.15 $56.65 $51.25 $48.75 
2 Elbeco - $43.50 $56.00 $51.40 $46.52 $43.50 
3 Elbeco - $53.35 $73.35 $59.95 $54.25 $48.75 
4 Propper - $28.09 $27.85 $29.20 $31.00 $27.50 
5 Propper - $27.09 $26.70 $28.00 $29.00 $28.75 
6 Propper - $24.18 $23.20 $24.35 $25.00 $24.00 
7 Propper - $17.28 $23.20 $18.25 $18.30 $18.00 
8 Hero’s - $4.32 $3.00 Blauer - $15.65 W/Monogram$6.50 $4.00 
9 Bayly - $61.33 No Bid $37.00 $38.50 $43.00 

10 Cornerstone-$21.65 $25.00 $21.90 $22.00 See Bid 
11 Southeastern-$26.99 $45.00 $35.90 $40.00 $35.00 
12 Southeastern-$24.99 $39.00 $30.90 $33.95 $30.50 
13 Southeastern-$25.99 $30.00 $29.80 $29.10 $29.50 
14 Speiwak - $99.84 $107.00 $103.00/3XL-6XL-$123.00 $102.80 See Bid 
15 Propper - $31.45 $30.50 $29.25 $30.55 $28.75 
16 Speiwak - $213.60 No Bid Tru-Spec-$146.50SM-5XL $215.00 JX833 Propper 3-in-1 

Hardshell Parka - $126.00 

17 Propper - $29.50 No Bid Tru-Spec-$35.50 $45.35 See Bid 
18 CR-Black/Navy/White/Heather Grey-

$22.00 No Bid Tru-Spec-$17.25 $38.00 See Bid 
Comments: Local Store one block away 

from Police Dept.  Free 
alterations on garment 
purchased from BKT 
Uniforms.  If awarded bid, 
we will stock try on sizes to 
outfit Dept. and carry class 
A uniforms in stock.  
Buying local will save the 
City of Kingsport money.  
No oversize or alterations 
charges. 

N/A N/A N/A N/A 

Delivery Time: 15 Days 14-21 Days 10 Days 10-15 Days 2-3 Days in stock; 
 7-10 for customized items 

 
 

The submitted bids will be evaluated and a recommendation made at a later date. 


